

Our Ref: ID 1659

NHS Wirral Clinical Commissioning Group  
Marriss House  
Hamilton Street  
Birkenhead  
Wirral  
CH41 5AL  
Tel: 0151 651 0011

## **Re: Freedom of Information Request - Neurorehabilitation**

Thank you for your request for information made under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, which was received into this office on 10<sup>th</sup> March 2020.

### **You Asked for:**

Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, I would like to request the following information regarding adult neurological and mental health residential and nursing home services. Please provide answers on the attached and accompanying spreadsheet.

For the avoidance of doubt, when referring to the term 'neurological', please include; brain injury (including acquired brain injury and traumatic brain injury) spinal injury, neuro-disabilities (including but not limited to Parkinson's disease, multiple sclerosis, motor neurone disease, Huntington's disease, cerebral palsy and epilepsy), stroke, neurobehavioural rehabilitation and cognitive rehabilitation. This list is meant as a guide and is by no means exhaustive.

For the avoidance of doubt, when referring to the term 'mental ill-health', please include; anxiety, depression, personality disorder, severe affective disorders, schizophrenia, and mental ill-health that causes challenging behaviour, all of which are to such a degree that the person experiences significant impairment and as such is unable to care for themselves independently. This list is meant as a guide and is by no means exhaustive.

1. Please provide the name, job title, email address and telephone number of the commissioner with responsibility for neurological and mental ill-health residential and nursing home placements (if more than one person is responsible, please provide the details of all responsible for making the placements).
2. Please provide the total number of adults funded by the Clinical Commissioning Group (CCG) in the following settings: (please provide figures for the past two financial years and budgeted figures for the current financial year (2019/20)):
  - a. Neurological residential homes
  - b. Mental ill-health residential homes
  - c. Neurological nursing homes
  - d. Mental ill-health nursing homes
3. Please provide the total number of adults funded by the CCG in out of area placements (i.e. a placement outside the CCG boundaries) in the following settings: (please provide figures for the past two financial years and budgeted figures for the current financial year (2019/20)):
  - a. Neurological residential homes

- b. Mental ill-health residential homes
  - c. Neurological nursing homes
  - d. Mental ill-health nursing homes
4. Please provide the gross total expenditure on adults funded by the CCG in the following settings: (please provide figures for the past two financial years and budgeted figures for the current financial year (2019/20)):
- a. Neurological residential homes
  - b. Mental ill-health residential homes
  - c. Neurological nursing homes
  - d. Mental ill-health nursing homes
5. Please provide the current average weekly expenditure per individual for adults funded by the CCG in the following settings:
- a. Neurological residential homes
  - b. Mental ill-health residential homes
  - c. Neurological nursing homes
  - d. Mental ill-health nursing homes

### **Our Response:**

Please see the attached sheet for further information.

Please note: Neurological conditions are not recorded by the Continuing Healthcare (CHC) Team on a mandatory basis, so this information is not held in a reportable format.

We hope this information is useful, however if you require any further information please do not hesitate to contact a member of the Corporate Affairs Team (contact details at the top of this letter)

### **Re- Use of Information**

Most of the information that we provide in response to Freedom of Information Act 2000 requests will be subject to copyright protection. In most cases the copyright will be owned by Wirral Clinical Commissioning Group. The copyright in other information may be owned by another person or organisation, as indicated on the information itself.

You are free to use any information supplied for your own non-commercial research or private study purposes. The information may also be used for any other purpose allowed by a limitation or exception in copyright law, such as news reporting. However, any other type of re-use, for example by publishing the information in analogue or digital form, including on the internet, will require the permission of the copyright owner.

For information where the copyright is owned by Wirral Clinical Commissioning Group please e-mail [foirequests.nhswirralccg@nhs.net](mailto:foirequests.nhswirralccg@nhs.net) to request a reuse licence.

For information where the copyright is owned by another person or organisation you must apply to the copyright owner to obtain their permission.